City of Parkville

Bid Tabulation

Renewal Contract

* Fluid Equipment

Alliance Pump &

Quotes Riverside, MO Mech.Service, Inc.
2023-2025 On-Call Pump Maintenance and Repair Services FTC Equipment Independence, MO
KCMO
BIDDER 1 BIDDER 2
Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Sub/Supplier List Included No No No
Report Samples Included Yes No No
Item [NON-EMERGENCY PREVENTATIVE MAINT. SERVICES Flat Rate Flat Rate Flat Rate
1 Hwy FF pump station - (2) Smith & Loveless Pumps Model #4B3B  15SHP 300.00 919.00 342.50
2 McAfee PS - (2) Sulzer Pumps Model #AFP 1077 ME430/4/43.60 68 HP 400.00 919.00 457.50
3 Pinecrest PS - (2) Sulzer Pumps Model #XFP100E-CB1.2PE105/4 14 HP 350.00 919.00 457.50
4 45 Highway PS - (2) Sulzer Pumps Model #XFP100E-CB1.6-PE45/4 6 HP 300.00 633.50 457.50
5 Nationals (2)- Sulzer Pumps Model #XFP101G-VX.6-PE230/2 30 HP 350.00 633.50 457.50
6 Riverhills PS (Flygt pumps) Model #31525.181-7791 15 HP 350.00 633.50 457.50
7 WWTF (3)-ABS and Sulzer Pumps 1-Model #AFP1546.2-M105/4 14 HP, 2- Model #XFP 105E-CB1.4-PE105/4 525.00 919.00 381.50 & 457.50
TOTALS $ 2,575.00 | $ 5,576.50| $ 2,630.00
EMERGENCY REPAIR SERVICES Flat Rate Flat Rate Flat Rate
Field Mechanic Regular Hrly 100.00 150.00 115.00
OT Hrly 150.00 220.00 172.50
W/E Hrly 150.00 220.00 172.50
Holiday Hrly 200.00 294.00 230.00
Shop Mechanic Regular Hrly 100.00 124.00 115.00
OT Hrly 150.00 186.00 172.50
W/E Hrly 150.00 186.00) 172.50
Holiday Hrly 200.00 249.00 230.00
Confined Space Entry Regular Hrly 100.00 150.00 per day| 125.00 per day
OT Hrly 150.00 150.00 per day| 125.00 per day)|
W/E Hrly 150.00 150.00 per day| 125.00 per day)|
Holiday Hrly 200.00 150.00 per day| 125.00 per day)|
BOOM Truck Trip charge (Including Operator) Regular Hrly 150.00 50.00 225.00
OT Hrly 150.00 50.00] 225.00
W/E Hrly 150.00 50.00] 225.00
Holiday Hrly 150.00 50.00] 225.00
COMMON REPAIRS
Basic Repair: Seals, O-Rings, hardware Non-Emerg. 1,050.00! 750.00 2,459.65
Emerg. 1,500.00 1,100.00 3,664.65
W/E Hrly 1,500.00 1,100.00 4,069.65
Holiday Hrly 1,500.00 294.00 4,069.65
Submersible Pump Motor Rewind OHP-70HP Non-Emerg. 500.00 120.00 per HP| 67.00
Emerg. 750.00 120.00 per HP| 73.00
W/E Hrly 750.00 120.00 per HP| 77.10
Holiday Hrly 750.00 120.00 per HP| 77.10
Vibration Analyses & Report Non-Emerg. 250.00! No Bid 650.00!
Emerg. 250.00 No Bid| 825.00
W/E Hrly 250.00 No Bid| 890.00
Holiday Hrly 250.00 No Bid| 940.00
Replace Bearings & Seals Non-Emerg. 1,050.00 1,500.00 3,190.76
Emerg. 1,500.00 2,200.00 3,995.76
W/E Hrly 1,500.00 2,200.00 4,874.76
Holiday Hrly 1,500.00 294.00 4,874.76/
Replace Seals Only Non-Emerg. 750.00] 450.00 2,459.65
Emerg. 950.00 660.00 3,264.65
W/E Hrly 950.00 660.00 4,069.65
Holiday Hrly 950.00 294.00 4,069.65
Replace Power Cord Non-Emerg. 250.00 600.00 2,700.11
Emerg. 250.00 880.00 3,160.11
W/E Hrly 250.00 880.00 3,620.11
Holiday Hrly 250.00 294.00 3,620.11
TOTALS $ 2,400.00 | $ 1,829.00| $ 2,280.00
Percent Markup $0.00-$1,999.00 0.30 0.33 0.25
$2,000 - $4,999.00 0.30 0.33 0.23
$5,000 and up 0.25 0.33 0.20
GRAND TOTALS $ 4,975.00 | $ 7,405.50 $ 4,910.00

* Bidder No. 1 did not acknowledge Addendum No. 1 and did not use the revised bid form with pump revisions



